
OUR VALUES: 
 
BELONGING 
Girls should feel a sense of  
belonging, support and connection. 
 
 
 
TRUST 
A respect for the mentors/advisors 
whose responsibility is to act as a 
trusted confidante. 
 
 
 
EMPOWERMENT 
Enabling the girls to make a positive 
change in their lives. 
 
 
 
INTEGRITY 
Acting in the best interest of the girls 
and their Mentors/Advisors. 
 
 
 
GROWTH 
Ultimate happiness through 
growth  of self for the greater good 
of the larger community. 
 
 
 
EXCELLENCE  
High standards are the aim and  
expectation in everything we do. 

PERSONAL  
SATISFACTION 
 
Mentors/Advisors also benefit from the  
mentorship relationship. They find  
fulfilment in helping the next generation 
of female leaders succeed. By sharing 
their knowledge, expertise and  
experience, mentors can have a positive 
impact on the lives of the girls. Mentors 
have the opportunity to give back to the 
community, which can be personally  
rewarding. 
 
In addition, Mentorship provides an  
opportunity to build a stronger, more  
vibrant community. 
 
Monthly meetings to include: 
• Workshops 
• Training Sessions 
• Theatre Outings 
• Museums 
• Corporate Day  

 

G.r.a.c.e. 
 

GIRLS REACHING ALL  
CONCEPTS OF EXCELLENCE 

 
"Empowering the next generation  

of Female Leaders" 

“Every great dream begins with a  

dreamer. Always remember you 

have within you the strength, the 

patience and the passion to reach 

for the stars to change the world.” 
 
- Harriet Tubman 
   Abolitionist and Political Activist 

CONTACT: 
Sonia Tracey - Program Director 
gracementoring1@gmail.com 
845.222.5973 
Augustina West, Ed. D. 
awest@ercsd.org 
845.577.6198 
Nicole Gladden Esq.  
nicolegladden@yahoo.com 
347.628.1612 



“COURAGE,   

SACRIFICE,  

DETERMINATION,  

COMMITMENT,  

TOUGHNESS,   

HEART,  

GUTS,  

 
That is what little girls are  

made of; the heck with  

sugar and spice” 

 

- Bethany Hamilton 
American Professional Surfer and Writer 

MISSION: 
 
Transforming lives of girls who deserve 
an equal opportunity to be the best  
version of themselves, through  
Mentorship, Advocacy and Service. 
 
To educate, inspire and empower girls 
with purpose and create positive change 
in their lives. 
 
 

TO DREAM BIG… 
 
Every girl deserves the chance to live a 
life worthy of her dreams. 
 
We achieve this goal through providing 
comprehensive programs and  
services  to  elevate the entire community. 
 
We envision a safe community that is 
healthy and vibrant. 

OVERVIEW: 
 
Our school-based mentoring/enrichment   
program for girls in the East Ramapo 
Central School District in middle schools 
through high schools, will provide sup-
port for girls who benefit from a positive 
role model to unlock their potential. 
 

Our mentors/advisors are strong,  
outstanding professionals and influential 
leaders in the community, business,  
entrepreneurship, government,  
academia, civic and cultural  
associations. 
 

Our program connects girls with these  
experienced female mentors who will  
offer guidance, advice and support that 
helps them with personal development. 
 

By providing a safe and supportive  
environment , mentors will help the girls 
gain increased confidence, build, and 
achieve self esteem. 
 

An essential component of the mentoring  
relationship includes creating caring,  
empathetic, consistent and long lasting  
relationships. 


